STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS.

S.I. No. 635 of 2010

TRUST RACs (FEES) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2010

(Prn. A10/1924)



2 [635]
S.I. No. 635 of 2010
TRUST RACs (FEES) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2010

I, EAMON O CUIV, Minister for Social Protection, in exercise of the powers
conferred on me by sections 5 and 25 (amended by section 37 of the Social
Welfare and Pensions Act 2007 (No. 8 of 2007)) of the Pensions Act 1990 (No.
25 of 1990) (as adapted by the Social and Family Affairs (Alteration of Name
of Department and Title of Minister) Order 2010 (S.I. No. 186 of 2010)), with
the consent of the Minister for Finance, hereby make the following regulations:

1. (1) These Regulations may be cited as the Trust RACs (Fees)
(Amendment) Regulations 2010.

(2) These Regulations come into operation on 1 January 2011.

2. In these Regulations “Principal Regulations” means the Trust RACs (Fees)
Regulations 2007 (S.1. No. 768 of 2007).

3. (1) Article 3(2) of the Principal Regulations is amended—
(a) in paragraph (a), by substituting “€8.00” for “€9.50”,
(b) in paragraph (b), by substituting “€4,000” for “€4,750”, and
(c) in paragraph (c), by substituting “€4.00” for “€4.75”.

(2) Article 3(3) of the Principal Regulations is amended—
(a) in paragraph (a), by substituting “€8.00” for “€9.50”,
(b) in paragraph (b), by substituting “€4,000” for “€4,750”, and
(¢) in paragraph (c), by substituting “€4.00” for “€4.75”.

The Minister for Finance consents to the making of the foregoing Regulations.

Notice of the making of this Statutory Instrument was published in
“Iris Oifigiuil” of 31st December, 2010.



[635]

GIVEN under the Official Seal of the Minister for Finance,
21 December 2010.

BRIAN LENIHAN,
Minister for Finance.

GIVEN under my Official Seal,
21 December 2010.

EAMON O CUIV,
Minister for Social Protection.



BAILE ATHA CLIATH
ARNA FHOILSIU AG OIFIG AN tSOLATHAIR
Le ceannach direach 6n
OIFIG DHIOLTA FOILSEACHAN RIALTAIS,
TEACH SUN ALLIANCE, SRAID THEACH LAIGHEAN, BAILE ATHA CLIATH 2,
no trid an bpost 6
FOILSEACHAIN RIALTAIS, AN RANNOG POST-TRACHTA,
AONAD 20 PAIRC MIONDIOLA COIS LOCHA, CLAR CHLAINNE MHUIRIS,
CONTAE MHAIGH EO,
(Teil: 01 - 6476834 né 1890 213434; Fax: 094 - 9378964 né 01 - 6476843)
no tri aon dioltdir leabhar.

DUBLIN
PUBLISHED BY THE STATIONERY OFFICE
To be purchased directly from the
GOVERNMENT PUBLICATIONS SALE OFFICE
SUN ALLIANCE HOUSE, MOLESWORTH STREET, DUBLIN 2,
or by mail order from
GOVERNMENT PUBLICATIONS, POSTAL TRADE SECTION,
UNIT 20 LAKESIDE RETAIL PARK, CLAREMORRIS, CO. MAYO,
(Tel: 01 - 6476834 or 1890 213434; Fax: 094 - 9378964 or 01 - 6476843)
or through any bookseller.
8-1-4064- -2

ISBN 97 47741
€1.27 || ||

9"781406"477412

Wt. (B28130). 285. 12/10. Cahill. Gr. 30-15.



